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Manchester 
Favors 
RFK Bid 
BALTIMORE, April 26 (AP) 

—William Manchester, author 
of a book on the assassination 
of President John F. Kennedy, 
has written an article favor-
able to the candidacy of Sen. 
Robert F. Kennedy. 

Manchester bad differences 
of opinion with the Kennedy 
family before publication of 
his book, "The Death of a 
President." 

Writing in today's Baltimore 
Evening Sun, Manchester said: 

"We can never re-create 
Camelot which, like the gold-
en age of Pericles, wasn't flaw-
less anyhow. However, an im-
provement upon the present 
disarray is certainly possible, 
and those who yearn for it 
should regard the new Ken-
nedy campaign as auspi-
cious . 

"It is highly likely that Ken-
nedy II would restore much 
that we have missed in the 
last four and a half years: the 
allegiance of youth, a sense of 
excitement about the Federal 
Government, and the involve-
ment of America's best minds 
in national affairs." 


