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Hoselli, claimed later to have been in-
volved in several assassination plots 
against Cuban leader Fidel Castro. 
Hoseill also has been subpoenaed to 
appear before the Senate panel. 

Mahen, accompanied by counsel Mor-
ton Galane, had only a series of no 
comments" to reporters' questions as he 
left the closed session. 

Asked if Maheu stood by his previous 
testimony on the Mafia, Galane said his 
client's testimony has always been con-
sistent." 

Maheu for four years ran Hughes' 
multi-million gambling and other 
operations in Nevada before the eccen-
tric recluse fired him in 1973 after say-
ing Maheu "robbed me blind." 

Maheu's name has cropped up in 
almost every investigation or allegation 
in connection with former President 
Richard M. Nixon, the Watergate scan-
dal, the CIA and its alleged ties with the 
Hughes empire, the Mafia and other 
matters. 

The Senate committee, which is con-
centrating on alleged CIA assassination 
plots, appears most interested in 
reputed connections with the Mafia. 


