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LSU Student Is One of 

Four Charged 

CHICAGO (AP) — Two Mil-
waukee men were sentenced to 
30 days in jail Monday as the 
first persons convicted of mob 
action in demonstrations during 
the Democratic National Con-
vention. 

Gary D. Dodson, 25, and John 
L. Schintgen, 22. were also 
fined $250. Two co-defendants, 
both Iranian exchange students, 
received one year's court su-
pervision for charges stemming 
from the same incident. 

They were Ebrahim Kateb, 
27, and Feraldoon Pedrami, 29, 
both of Chicago. Kateb is a 
senior at Louisiana State Uni-
versity and Pedrami is a se-
nior at the Missouri School of 
Mines. 

Police said the four men 
threw rocks at patrolmen on 
Aug. 29. 

Two newsmen charged with 
disorderly conduct were grant-
ed continuances Monday. 

Their attorney said they were 
assigned to cover the presiden-
tial campaigns- 

Stuart Loory, 36, a reporter 
for the Los Angeles Times, and 
Erwin Knoll, a reporter for the 
Madison, Wis., Capital Times, 
were ordered to appear Oct. 21 
before Magistrate Lewis Gil-
berto. 

Loory and Knoll were arrest-
ed and charged with disorderly 
conduct Aug. 29. They are free 
on $250 bond. 

A disorderly conduct charge 
against Miss Gall A. Carter, 
27, of 1345 Madison Park, 
Brooklyn, N. Y., was dismissed. 


