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TV Needs More, Not 

Less, News Analysis 



By Fred W. Friendly 
Friendly is Edward R. Murrow pro. 

lessor of broadcast journalises at 
Columbia University's Graduate School 
of Journalism. The following is excerpt-
ed from an address Friday at the Cali- 

. fornia institute of Technology. 

N DEFENDING Vice President 
I Agnew, one of the most fair-
minded men in the U.S. Senate said: 
"It is the pig that is caught under the 
fence that squeals." The analogy may 
he partly accurate, but the question is, 
who was stuck under the fence — the 
broadcast journalist or the administra-
tion? 

Long ago when broadcasting was 
fighting for its right to be responsi-
ble, Edward it. Morrow, then under at-
tack, spoke words which might be par-
aphrased today: When the record is fi-
nally written, it will answer the ques-
tion: Who helped the American people 
understand the dilemma of Vietnam—. 
the administration or the American 

- - journalist? History will, of course, de-
cide cide that question. But I would suspect 
that in the recent struggle between the 
news media and the last two adminis- 

: tratlons, the record has been with the 
' . ournalists. 

e American people are worried 
out Vietnam, race and youth, the 

• three crucial stories of our time. What . -. 
the Vice President is attempting to do 
is create doubts in the minds of the 
American public about the motivation 
and background of those charged with 
the responsibility of trying to under-
stand and explain these complicated 
and sensitive controversies. 

When Agnew asks, "Are we demand-
ing enough of our television news pres-
entations?," he Is certainly asking a 
question that others, including many 
Inside the profession, have asked for a 
generation. For some, the Vice Presi-
dent's questions seemed to be about 
raised eyebrows, caustic remarks and 
too much news analysis. For me. It was 
really a speech about too little analysis. 

In fact, the Viee President may have 
provided almost valuable service in 
his Des Moines speech. He sharpened 
an issue that has been diffuse for too 
long, inviting us all to consider once 
again the state of broadcast journal-
ism. 

Agnew and I share the view that 
television journalism leaves some-
thing to be desired. We both fear 
the concentration of great power in a 
few individuals in the broadcasting in-
dustry. But we are apparently in pra-
found disagreement not only on the 
nature of the networks' coverage of 
the President's Vietnam address but, 
even more importantly, on our crying 
need for more, not less, interpretive 
reporting. We require bolder, not bland-
er, illumination of the issues that di-
vide men of reason. 

Where Agnew went astray, in my 
view, was in his suggestion that .the 
media ought somehow to be a conduit 
for the views of the government, or 
merely a reflector of public opinion. 
He was not the first nor will he be the 
last high official to equate fairness and 
the possession of great power with the 
obligation of conformity. 

The Vice President has forgotten 
history when he oritieizes ABC's jour-
nalistic enterprise in arranging for 
Ambassador Harriman to participate 
in the broadcast that followed Mr. Nix-
on's speech of Nov. 3. I don't think 
President Kennedy rejoiced In having 
Sen, Homer Capehart (l;-Inds critique 
his Berlin crisis speech of 1961 or Ladd 
Plumley, president of the National 
Chamber of Commerce, pursuing him 
after his controversial 1962 speech on 
the state of the economy. How many 
times after a major address did Presi-
dent Johnson have to listen to the cut-
ting remarks of minority leaders Dirk-
sett and Ford? 

It was all part of the democratic 
process. Alter all, the President had 
had prime time on all three networks 
and a small measure of counterfire 
from the loyal opposition was hardly 
stacking the deck. In the end of the 
day, perhaps ABC might not be faulted 
for inviting Ambassador Harriman, an 
experienced negotiator with the Hanoi 
government, but rather for not asking 
him enough hard questions. 

The Vice President doubts that Pres-
ident Kennedy, during the Cuban mis-
sile crisis of 1962, had his words 
"chewed over by a roundtable of crit-
ics" Immediately following his address 
to the nation. Would the Vice Presi-
dent believe Sander Vanocur, Ray 
Scherer, Frank McGee, David Schoen- 



bran, Roger Mudd, George Herman, 
Richard C. Hottelet and Douglas Ed. 
wards? The date on that is Oct. 22, 
1962, 

The Vice President did not mention 
the Bay of Pigs, but certainly he must 
remember the news analysis and the 
GOP counterbriefings that followed. 
President Kennedy, who earlier had 
called upon broadcasters for self-cen-
sorship of the story in the national in-

' terest, later told the managing editor 
of The New York Times that revela-
tion of the Bay of Pigs plan might 
have saved the nation "a colossal mis-
take." 

A Durable Description 
A GENERATION AGO, the most 

savage denouncements against 
news analysis involved Sen. Joseph 
McCarthy. In an inflammatory speech 
in Wheeling, W.Va., in 1950, he de-
clared there were 205 Communists in 
the State Department. Good news an-
alysis, in fact good reporting, would 
have required that the journalist not 
just hold his mirror up to that star-
tling event, but that he report that the 
senator bad not one scrap of evidence 
to substantiate so extravagant a claim. 

It Look broadcasting several years 
during the McCarthy period to learn 
that merely holding up a mirror could 
be deceptive, as in fact holding up a 
mirror to a riot or a peace march 
today can be deceptive. It took the 
shame of the McCarthy period and the 
courage of an Ed Murrow to elevate 

broadcast journalism to a point where 
it could give responsible insights to is• 
sues such as those raised by the junior 
senator from Wisconsin. 

For generations, editors and stu-
dents of journalism have tried to de-
fine news analysis and interpretive re-
porting. The late Ed Klauber, one of 
the architects of broadcast news stand-
ards, provided the most durable de-
scription. I have always kept it in my 
wallet, and I provide copies to all my 
students at the Columbia Graduate 
School of Journalism: 

"What news analysts are entitled to 
do and should do is to elucidate and il-
luminate the news out of common 
knowledge, or special knowledge pos-
sessed by them or made available to 
them by this organization through its 
sources. They should point out the 
facts on both sides, show contradic-
tions with the known record, and so 
on. They should bear in mind that in a 
democracy it is important that people 
not only should know but should un-
derstand, and it is the analysts' func-
tion to help the listener to understand, 
to weigh and to judge, but not to do 
the judging for him," 

If the Vice President would Lest the 
brief analyses of Nov. 3 against Klaub-
er's criteria, I think he might agree 



that the correspondents did not cross 

the line in any attempt to make up the 

viewer's mind on a course of action. 
Agnew felt that the response to the 
President on Nov. 3 was instant analy-
sis. But it seems fair to remind the 
Vice President that the administration 
had provided correspondents with ad-
vance copies of the speech for study 
earlier that evening, and there had 
been a persuasive White House brief-
ing on the content- 

While the comments of the corre-
spondents were clearly appropriate, 
my own personal opinion is that only 
those of Sevareid and Marvin Kalb 
were probing and thoughtful. Kalb 
conceivably erred in not quoting perti-
nent paragraphs from the Ho Chi 
Minh letter which he believed were 
subject to different interpretation 
from that of the President 

A Blank Cheek 

P'DART OF OUR Vietnam dilemma 
is that during the fateful August 

of 1964 when the Tonkin Gulf resolu-
tion escalated the war, there was little 
senatorial debate worthy of the name, 
and there was a dramatic shortage of 
news analysis. If I am inclined to give 
the networks an A for effort and a B 
for performance the night of Nov. 3, 
1969, let me tell you that I give CBS 
News and myself a D for effort and 
performance on the night of Aug. 4, 
1964, when President Johnson, In his 
Tonkin Gulf speech, asked for a blank 
check on Vietnam. 

In spite of the pleas of our Washing-
ton bureau, I made the decision to 
leave the air two minutes after the 
President concluded his remarks. I 
shall alwayi believe that if journalism 
had done its 'job properly that night 
and in the days following, America 
might have been spared some of the 
agony that followed the Tonkin Gulf 
resolution. 

I am not saying that we should 
have, in any way, opposed the Presi-
dent's recommendations. But, to quote 
Klauber's doctrine of news analysis, if 
we had "out of common knowledge or 
special knowledge . . . pointed out the 
facts on both sides, shown contradic-
tions with the known record. . .", we 
might have explained that after bomb-
ers would come bases, and after bases, 
troops to protect those bases, and after 
that, hundreds of thousands of more 

troops. 
Perhaps it is part of the record to 

note that Ed Marrow, who understood 
the value of interpretive journalism 
from his years as a practitioner and 
from his experience as director of the 
U.S. Information Agency, called min- 

utes after the Johnson speech to casti-
gate me and CBS for not providing es-
sential analysis of the meaning of the 
event. 

One key aspect of the Vice Presi-
dent's speech did strike me as relat- 
ing to the 	bile interest, as dis- 
tinguished fran the administration's 
political interest, This was his concern 
over the geographic and corporate con-
centration of power in broadcasting. 

Here he had the right target, but a 
misdirected aim. 

His criticism of broadcasters for cen-
tralization and conformity better de-
scribes the commercial system and its 
single-minded interest in maximum 
ratings and profits. 

There is an independent, sometimes 
awkward complex of network execu-
lives, station managers, producers and 
reporters whose joint production is the 
news we see. They represent a geo-
graphic, ethnic, political profile nearly 
as far-ranging as American society it-
self, with the tragic exception of 
blacks. 

The heads of the three major net-
work news bureaus find their constit-
uencies and their critics among the 
station managers they serve, the corre-
spondents they employ, sponsors they 
lose, and in the wider public they 
please and occasionally disappoint. 
The news program emerges from a 
complicated system of argument, con-
flict and compromise. 

Beyond that, the record suggests 
- that the best professionals recognize 
and acknowledge their limitations. 
Walter Cronkite was the first to admit 
that he erred in some of his reporting 
at the 1968 Democratic convention. It 
was David Brinkley, admitting that no 
reporter could always be objective but 
only strive for fairness, who gave the 
Vice President a high-visibility target. 

Yet, if the Vice President's aim was 
wild, his target of concentrated power 
is valid and endures. The "truth" of 
commercial broadcasting is that it 
maximizes audiences by maximizing 
profits. This system minimizes the 
presentation of hard news and analy-
sis, leading the broadcast journalists 
into occasional oversimplification in 
the interest of time, overdramatization 
in the interest of Impact. 

Expanding the System 

IF SUCH DISTORTING tenden-
cies do exist, and I believe they 

sometimes do, the proper measure is 
not to subject the performance of pro-
fessional journalists to governmental 
direction or to majority approval. 
Rather, the task for government is to  

apply its Leadership ana rimie.4. 	1.1.0 
expand and diversify the broadcasting 
system and environment in which pro-
fessional journalists work. 

The Communications Act insisted 
that license holders operate their Iran-
chise "in the public interest, conveni-
ence and necessity." By every defini-
tion I have ever heard, that Includes 
responsible news coverage. The FCC 
would be fulfilling long-standing na-
tional policy by demanding more, not 
less, public service broadcasting from 
the commercial systems, as well as by 
accelerating development of a publicly 
supported noncommercial alternative. 

The Vice President quotes Walter 
Lippmann to make a case that the net-
works have hidden behind the First 
Amendment. He does not add that 
Lippmann's point was that this demon-
strated the necessity for just such a 
competitive, alternate system which 

most commercial broadcasters today 
support. 

Lippmann has also said that "the 
theory of a free press is that the truth 
will emerge from free reporting and 
free discussion, not that it will be pre-
sented perfectly and instantly in any 
one account." 

Just Filling Time 
TN THE DAYS since the Vice 

President's speech, I have been 
jarred by the strange coalition of 
Americans who find an assortment of 
reasons for identifying with parts of 
the Vice President's remarks. I pain-
fully learned that the reservoir of 
goodwill that broadcast journalists 
could once rely on in time of crisis has 
now been partially dissipated. 

Perhaps if the public knew that the 
broadcast newsman was fighting for 
longer news programs, fewer commer-
cials, more investigative reporting. 
there might be a broader sense of 
identity. 

The broadcast journalist knows how 
little news analysis appears on the air. 
Five or eight minutes after a major 
presidential address is not interpretive 
journalism as much as it is time to be 
filled to the nearest half-hour, or to 
the nearest commercial. He also knows 
that a half-hour minus six commercials 
is just not enough air time to present 
and analyze the news properly. 

Perhaps the broadcast newsman of 
today can no longer afford the luxury 
of abdicating his role in a decision-
making process that now so clearly af-
fects his profession and his standards, 
He is a far better newsman than the 
public ever sees and he has far more 
power to change the system than he 



and the public imagine. 
For a long time, the broadcasting 

companies have relied on the prestige 
of their news organizations to enhance 
their own corporate prestige—in fact. 
their very survival. The reputation of 
these newsmen is now at stake. 

They need to do their best, not their 
worst. They need to be seen at their 
most courageous, not to slip into timid-
ity. This is not a time for public rela-
tions experts, although there will be a 
frantic search for a corporate line that 
will qnce again salvage the good name 
of broadcasting. 

Television's battles will not be 
fought or won on the polemics of cor-
porate handouts, First Amendment 
platitudes or full-page ads. They will 
be won by what is on the air, and they 
will be lost by what is not on the air. 
It is later than they think, and we all 
have Agnew to thank for.reminding us 
of that. 

An Accurate Label 
"JERE WE STAND, with the image 
IL orthicon tube, the wired city and 
the satellite, the greatest tools of com- 
munication that civilization has ever 
known, while the second highest office 
holder in the land implies that we use 
them less. Here we are in l£169, Mr, 
Vice President, with one leg on the 
moon and the other on earth, knee 
deep in garbage. That's going to re-
quire some news analysis. 

What the Vice President says is that 
he wants editorials (which network 
news divisions don't use) labeled for 
what they are. Certainly it is general 
custom to label news analysis and com-
ment when it is taking place, and omis-
sion of that, even under the pressure 
of time, is a mistake 

But Agnew ought to label his speech 
for what it was. Did he want to encour- 
age responsible journalism, or did he 
wish to silence it? 

Perhaps the journalist and the 
party in power are always destined to 
be on the outs. President Eisenhower 
was pretty sore with television news 
until be left office, when he became a. 
big fan. President Kennedy was read-
ing and watching more and enjoying it 
less. President Johnson watched three 
sets and knew how to talk back to 
three talking heads at once, and the 
Nixon administration has let us know 
where It stands. 

It is my theory that when the mes-
sage from Des Moines or the White 
House itself is always a valentine or a 
garland of flowers, television and radio 
will have failed their purpose, 


