
Sirhan Jurors 
To Be Queried 
In Secrecy | 

By GEORGE ZUCKER 
A.o$ ANGELES (AP)—Somd 
uestioning of prospective jurors 

in the Sirhan Bishara Sirhan, 
rial will be conducted behind 
losed doors, the defense says, 

t B. Cooper, one of three 
lawyers defending the 24-year’ 
old Jordanian charged with} 
murdering Sen. Robert F. Ken- 
nedy, revealed plans for thq 
secret questioning during an 
impromptu news conference 
yesterday at the end of the 
third day of Sirhan’s trial. The 
trial was in recess today. Jury 
selection is expected to start 
Monday. . 

Cooper said’ Judge Herbert VY 
Walker wants prospective iy 

cross-examined individually 
privacy of his eer 

eas “of a sensitive nature.’ 

COOPER DEFINED as sensi- 
tive any questioning about opin- 
ions prospective jurors might 
have on Sirhan’s guilt or in- 
nocence—What they may have 
seen on television or read in| 
the newspaper.””: 

But Cooper said questions 
about the death penalty would 
be asked in open court. He 
said the secret questioning was} 
“unprecedented in this jurisdic- 
tion.” 

Sirhan appeared for the nine- 
minute court session, then re- 
tired to the judge’s chambers 
with defense attorneys and pros- 
ecutors to hear private testi- 
mony from radio newsmen| 
about publicity in the case. 

THE DEFENDANT was 
dressed in a new blue-gray 
suit and tie. He was accom- 
panied by two guards. 

While the judge spoke in 
opening the session, Sirhan 
‘tuned in his chair and, eye- 
qirows arched, searched ~- the 

row of the courtroom for 
is family. 

,| For the first time since his} 
“tial began Tuesday, his mother 

ary and his brothers Adel, 
i , and Munir, 21, all were ab- 
ft. Sirhan appeared disap- 

UlULeU, 

MOST OF THE day’s oro f 
ceedings took place in cham 
ber as the defense tried to show 
Sirhan’s case was damaged by 
news stories and similar coy- 
rage, ‘ 
Ten radio newsmen and a 

man who runs a private broad- 
cast monitoring service were 
subpenaed to testify i 
chambers. atify in the 

nacu was austructed” Hor to 
discuss publicly what was said 
—and all followed instructions. 

“BOYS, I'VE been given the 
warning,” said Herb Hum- 
phreys, news editor for station! 
KFWB, Los Angeles. “So hello 
and goodbye.” 

Before the jury selection be- 
gins Monday, the defense is ex- 
pected to make another closed- 
door attempt before Walker to 
Hiavé ‘the list of prospective 
jurors set aside. 

Sirhan’s lawyers contend pro- 
spective trial jurors and grand 
jurors are selected in Los An- 
geles County in a way that 
counters court opinion that 
juries should be representative 
of ‘a true cross section of 

| community.” y 
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