Freedom of Information
| and |
Privacy Acts

Subject: Yuri Ivanovich Nosenk

File Number: 65-68530
Section: 107




’-., w1l - .-".;. ‘)‘k-_- WA DML AL ;.'-'.«.7 . 3 e
.. :
: ;—"“*- : - SRCGRET
ALL INFORMAT _— s ' =
. E SHOV.! omzamsa Operatlons "";_L‘.;i“ _}
- _Files 29 July 197 \

- Cpy Rpt of 29 July 7§ S

1975 )
vln

2. An otiziul ud sqm :3 l
, thls orandum and “are be
sm ‘istribution &s prev!.ou Opotatiogl

Attachment:

BLS:

WARNING N .
SENSTIIVE INTELLIGERCE SOURGES

:lmth'
h&z e

e ._

AND METHODS (NYOLVED




R4

AN

o£ Seeurity. cn. Qu.;m shown |
" ”_.- The uctp contdn

. -
.. L

2BX__Jr
CIA teffe ditzp &

5
._.. E
7
3
o

(7

R
; P
t N

L Ch4, U

OE o ; .
b 24 /776’7»@‘% Wh i;d 4 - é -
!‘: charaSed M% .M:LU,) i




M-w“-"-b'.-j B

) FOIPA 3
DELETED PAGE INFORMATION SHEET
'31 Page(s) withheld catirely at his location in the file. One or more of the following statements, where indicaied,
release to you. oo C
Ko per CiA oemw 0 @
0 o) O ®X7XE) o 0@ N
woe) L CIA oeme - f o @ "
750 YSC Spo. W3  « OOO) 0 ®e
' 0 ®NE O ®E)
a ®X7XF) . . a &x4) ’:
) O ®X8) T a me)
¢
O ®X5) . a o)X =T g
a e o ®m
a Infoxmuonpaumedonlytouhxrdpmywnhnotefam (othcsubjectofyourrequeuormesubjeaofyowé
request is listed in the title only. <
O Documents originated with another Government agency(ics) These documents were refecred to that ageacyGies) s
formewanddimansponsetoyou. 7
Pagsmmﬁninformﬁmﬁmiﬂndbymwwu). You will be advised by the FBI as
- to the releasability of this information following our consultation with the other agency(ies). 3
Page(s) withheld inasmuch as a final release determination has not been made. You will be-advised 35 0 the .-
.  disposition at a later date. ' ) -
Pages were not considered for release as they are duplicative of ' *
Page(s) withheld for the following reason(s):
X‘lbefonzf nmbaistobeused!.form tegrdmgdmepags:
. . - - . .
X Deleted Page(s) X
X No Duplication Fee X
X  for this page X
AXXXXX |

e e o, = e e mmasm t e ——n o ———— s



B - . . S T IRy NPTy P PP e PR R R Tt T SR PPN U A A SR
2 8 ALY gy N o’ 18 o i - o aakadnatbd ol ” - Z hednidh o .
* ) "= - 2 -

- e B . O " &"“ ‘sti { g . . -~

ALLlNFORMATION’NTAINED Copy # € of 8 N
. HEREIN IS UNCLASSIFIED EXCEPT a‘ OperatIonal Nemo m-m s
YWHERE SHOVH OTHERWISE. ;

29 Mmt 1975

view was not recorded s Ipt will not be i

2. An original and°weven copies have been made of
this memorandum and attachmeant sund are being given. thn

4 1. The attached of the fntervik 9 Atigust B
1975 was prepared s:m/n:. nce inte¥- <%

Ll

M g pp g
AT SAO T,

-

same di.stri.button as provlm Opuuond Nemorands..

b
-1 "
i

e
. !

Bruce L. Solie

|~

\

4 Attachment:
- Cpy Rpt of 28 August 1975 6:7, ;
: >

“B
- RECS9

-9 s-oa0

CLASSIFIED BY

LASSIFYO 5X,_/ s O np.— :
- %Cl W{i - (

)
1

N
1}
§
&
R

Eaidt R L B S

-]
B
(7]
m
in -
-t
@
-l
w
~J
N
Y

-8
»

o .

NERR) .46 TION :
1652, EXSHIFTIOR CATEGORY b
or (1) (circle one or more)

LY DE;L{SSIPIED OoN

‘Ytle ‘ z '
UL vy ynots ; B

- V -‘..
DRSO,
e i i e e S P - - vy —— S
’ r 4
— e e




P

BY S2ac

e

I
N i N

y—
& L0

V)

:’t” FHa ;..L‘l

-~ »\,-‘ -“.x.-(;_‘{l

=

Vst |

CLASSIFIED

C

L »
NN Ny v - ¥
i Iy Yomba v
o
) (/ “ ) P ; M
-~ - 4 “
3 e ) & & - '
ot aiioe) . e N A &
3 .
Ay L
Y 53 i




x Nmmmmmn&emmduwwﬁmwm available for &

. XXXXXX
X0
x FEDERAL BUREAU OF lNVES'lId
» . FOIPA : . ' PN
DELETED PAGE INFORMATION SHEET = L X

Page(s) withheld entirely at this location in the file. One or more of the following statements, where indicated,
explain this deletion. , . . , -

release to you. , | 3
X“”“’ﬁ@l’Clﬁ g &M - ’ ) 0 @) |

a ®X2) o ome - ‘o m ,
oo perCA - oemo ¢ oem

50 USC Spe. 03 — OO0 0 ®e)

; ' O ®)XTXE) a ®e) 1

O GXE 0 &9 ’if

QO &)X a oXe) o ®6) E

O &% o e 0 &6 f

O ®X9 0 ®o z

O Information pertained ouly o a thid party with no reference 1o the subject of your request ord:eijeuofy«é?
request is listed in the title oaly. | : 3

O Documents originated with another Government agency(ies). These documents were referred €0 that agency(ies)

Pages contain information furnished by snother Government ageacy(ics). You will be. advised by the FBI as

Page(s) withheld inasmuch as a final relesse determination has not been made. You will be-advised as to the

Pagswacnotconsdemd for release as they are duplicative of
Page(s) mwmmws):

b

to the releasability of this information following our consultation with the other agency(ies).

dispbsition at a later date.

b Ve T B Lo

- x The ing pumber is to reference regarding these pages: '3'
4 . - =

X Deleted Page(s) X 3

X No Duplication Fee X -

X  for this page X R

XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX ;

XXXXXX ;
XXXXXX 2
XXXXXX Feool

. _‘_._~ ‘w— . .




e T & T
e ARGy pof ) | &

| Copy # £ of 8-+ - \:-
aEREgN‘ ,UffCLASSIFIED EXCEPT ; Opgzatiml Memo - #N-578
HERESHOW OTHERWISE, ™ - - il
-/‘ . ) ) q :
Files . \D

. 26 August 197s

" (24 " .
. . ', ,’“(i’ll H
el ﬁ‘*(: ¥ V B
Eﬂﬁ‘* b\,‘a-
1. The attached :

. t of the interview of 26 August
1975 was prepared by SA

; /FBI. Since the inter-
L@  view was not recorded a traascript will not be available.

2. An original and seven copies have been made of
R | S this memorandum and attachment and gre being given the
A — same distribution as previous Operational Memorands. .

i | Bruce L. Solie
S .=~ Attachment:
S O Cpy Rpt of 26 Aug 75

:‘ q
1 m.s.

CLASSIFIED BY

DECLASSIFY ON: [
pencs oo ehq9 |

t .
b - — —~ - S S




]

IFiED

¥ QO

CLA

DRWIAITU ft&‘

ER]

[ 2R

Q
\ 4 "
<
h
A - -
) - hd
N - ~ b ”
- a .
\ 3 .
o4 ‘ ;
0
- *
-~
U -
- A“,V
Z -

\Yy

‘,
N . N
“
. N ,
Dy -
*
N / 5 (Kool 7
-y ) () ' (]
", p
2 3 /] u . \

-~
AR A il o AP A 4 N . s BB A e a n oan e o



ﬁﬂhmﬁM@MnmwmmmuWmmmummmmmmumuf

xz:::TmM@wumMmmemdm?@&mﬂm@mr %
Koo perCiA 0 G . oD@ !
. oo | © O ene a 0 ;
Yoo pau-CA O &0 ¢ = ) *
:@amﬁﬁﬂﬂﬁ o &N 0 ®E %
| ' O &E d@m %

a OXIXF) . . a (k)«)

a o)X o &) )

o xS : a o O &x6)

O ®9 - o ®m

0O Information pertained only to a third party with no reference to the subject of your request onhesnbjeacfwa-
request is listed in the title only. -

for review and direct response to you. é“
hgsmmﬁnhfmﬁmﬁmﬁedbymmw(u). Youwmbeudvisedbylheﬂls 5'1'
", % the releasability of this information following our cousultation with the other agency(ies). g
mmwmmmumhMm@ﬁﬁMmMumummmmmmuﬁ
.  dispbsition at a Iater date. : _ . X
Page(s) withheld for the following reason(s): ' §
= - 3
R‘nne i ;ﬁmberismbensedformwum .- f:
000OOOTONKK
X Deleted Page(s) X
- . X No Duplication Fee X -
‘ X forthispage X =
_ XXXXXXXXXXNXKXHKKX X
XXXXXX . . g
XXXXXX =,




Rdj %MT : RNMENT . . _" . |
SR ndum SQQRH . N
zgmron, FBI (65-68530) Sh}’g‘-“ ' DATE: 8/28/75%‘(& )
(N : . .
?qrfﬁf' |
ALL IRFORMATT OB Cox S,

HERETN IS UNCTASS EX
WHERE SHOWY Or:zR

' -—ehm FORM NO. tO
JULY 1973 ED'TION
GSA FPMR a1 CFra) 101. e

Enclosed are 5 copies fo

7
/

-
> acf%
/—""-\

Classified %S " since it contains info from %
? and CIA has requested that info from this asset } \
be so classified to protect the asset, e i
The source in the LHM i who was’ !./
interviewed on 8/26/75 by SA .

g
d
Inasmuch as a representative of CIA was present
during interview of asset on 8/26/75, it is not considered

ecessary that a copy of the enclosed ILHM be dissemina.ted
o CIA.\

[..-k..\.- | S"”"‘“ xx%. s Lo k 11

G"s: CAT 18 sep o

e

DECLASSIFY ON: 25

(11 Uy

(2 - Bureau (Enc.g}c‘mm

I -
- x A .
. ‘-- -. oemaw q-.qod\! ﬁ\q“" ﬁE ‘i:A

":r"r- T ) R /
&-.:-:..--...'......'.,....-_..-..,, OE -.Bj

- 6 19753% U.S. Savings Bonds Regdcrl] E&G)tygf.ﬁnng; Plan

. ———




R el Sk e ta e o el o e ki comnigd

T - el At i O it kg . g e
l. @ ' v kp STATES DEPARTMENT OF TICEj‘ \;\B

DA
oo
L)

RMATION CONTMNED:RAL BUREAU OF INVESTIGATION \07‘\ fg" ?

LOb

. REREN IS UNCLASSIFIED EXCdshington, D, C. 20535 o Siﬁm
406! OTHERWISE. "28, 18 “
I L O (August 28, 19757q) A

R S 4

concern captioned matters furnished on August 26, 1975

b a former officer of the Soviet Committee for -
State Security fu

in the past,

IerTED prp
R T TTENIOR
i S, B, 1242, )
CATE GF REVIEY F

DECLASSIFiCATION




¥ FEDERAL BUREAU OF INVESTIC] )ON - - .
. . FOIPA . . .. -,
DELETED PAGE INFORMATION SHEET :

“ Page(s) withheld catirely at this location fn the file. One or moee of the following statements, whese jadicaind,

Delctions were made pursuant to the exemptions inficand below with no segregable matcrial available for &

. Tclease 10 you. * - . i
X‘”"",ﬂekClﬁ- 0 GOW .. o@o !
o o) O ®XB) S N0 s
Yoo perCA Coemo . ¢ oen
535/5(’ See. 20.3 | o oo | | oO®e

' o0 eO® 0 ®e

a ®X7IXP . R = | (ki(4) %

0 ®&X9)  oem 0 ®® :;r
o ®&) : o e O ®&® 5
R L0) : a &

O Information pertained only to a third party with no reference to the subject of your request orthesul'ptofm.
request is listed in the title only. :

"o

o WWMWWWm). M&mmnfmﬁwmmg

' Pages coatain information funished by another Government agency(ies). You will be advised by the FBl a5 °
: to the releasability of this information following our consultation with the other agency(es). &
——— Pagels) withbeld inasmuch as a final relesse determination hat not boen made. You will be-advisd as 0o the -
. dispbsition at a later date. ) ) -
—— Pages were not considered for release s they are duplicative of ~&
—— Page(s) withheld for the following reason(s): =

x‘mefol%’ mﬂukmszamw'&m- _ : ' ‘

- XXXXXX _ i ]
XXXXXX o : 3
XXXXXX S revcs




ool NG I s g 2Nl A

WAI. FORM N0, 10
JUI. 373 TOTION
PR (41 Cra

PROPRINTE JGEHETEE o
T03XAWD PIELOOIFICES \
ADVISED BYROWIRG ¢ (7

SLIP (S) ¢
. Ar.‘m.!'
ReWFOlet, 9/2/75, encf B Copies bff

-2;.m:::33};m;1;‘,ﬁ&- FBIHO to : 60
A‘D <

Qr dissemination
y H O [ A ‘ '

. Classified “SEQRET" since it contains info from_
V\\‘ and CIA has requested nfo from this asset be so cla
< to protect the asset

ssified

copy each o sts
ize the names and limited

Although not yet ’d:l D
depicted in th

§

: 2.0 q O L

N Bure.au‘ .(E'nc 80) 34 ‘ R >

‘e iy Et 1-legat,Mexico) (GS-SZ(D&‘@) , ot o5 et -
s(" _ é:?"-jw (40%)’"'—:?1.'30 T et IO EEE
4& : F' . .” ' | .

it “F’;g:.i{':‘: FOR—p ] *35

o ibe amll .fcvmg: Pl




L INFORMAIWE
tRElN IS ONC o

SHOW

(00:WFO) CLASS\FIED B\*'

GECLASSIFY ON: g&mm
_ ReWFOlet, 8/4/75, reportir mterview of
on 7/29/75 and 8/1/75 concerning

WFOle 9/16/75, enclosing for Bureau for T

.2 . -
PRI Y s v TR T

IWFOfile L A porting info

SN R
Enclosed for the Bureau for transmittal to

areZ;:oie acho
I‘Mm,'é 1zes the Names g

ebpies of List # g
nited biog aphic data of thesg} 8o enclased forthe
A are 1 copy each off

Bureau for dissemination to C

« N
fa ¢
=y -~

and Copy of List ¥#2/46 wn
biographic data of these ]

-eplzes the names and 1imi;
/ER

During interview on 9 24 75
limited hiographic data of

York{Into YK 1 ()=6

o4

an Franci.sco ( ‘ ‘5-'




DS R ATICN) i' r. PRAICR M SN 2RI DR SR EATIONERT S P £ e e

ks M)wmmcumms):

| Pages were not considered for relcase 25 they are duplicative of

DELETED PAGE INFORMATION SHEET
ms)wmmayammhmmmgm«umw.mm

b}
e
AT

x Deletions were made pursuant to the excmptions indicated below with mo scgrogable matcrial availabie for
release ¢o you. - L

. %

Xoo por i aoow . oam
a ®X2) | T Oene : - ooo
o LerC/A - oomo . - ¢ o axn

{OQIQC'_&@. 5@3. o oMo . owe

PR SR e b

QO Information pertained oaly t0 a third party with no refereace o the subject of your request or the subject of your £
- request is listed in the title only. g

a mwmmww:w. These documents were referred to that agency(ies) |

Pages contain information furnished by another Government ageacy(ics). You will be advised by the FBI as
. mﬁexdmabﬂay'ofmkhfmmﬁmfdhﬁngmmhﬁonwﬁﬁeduwaa).

—— Page(s) withheld inssmuch as a final release determination has not bocn made. You will be-advissd 5 o o 8
. disposition at a later date. |

3 3 .o ) . o '
xmm Mkw&&d&rmmﬂmmm - "
X Deleted Page(s) X
X No Duplication Fee X ‘
X  for this page X
AXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX

PYNARETOR S o ST L T

;

A
N, e




