am sig

JL - C.A.76-1996, CTIA Item; C.A.(6-1997- CIA Motion to Identes HW 6/21/78

With this there will be the original of what I've already sent you. You may or may not have read it then. I believe it is relevant now. It is short notes I made on the FRI's response to the ETIA Item of the 1996 request.

These all relate to the King assassination. The CIA has not acted on referrals and the FEI has done nothinb about it. I think this means non-compliance in both suits given the time lapse.

Looks like I was correct in believing that the reason Hoover did not ask for files on Gook is because he had office files (phural no accident- see today's earlier memo). So why not act as though I was correct on his files holding the records not provided on hill Turner?

I do not know where the notes to which I refer in my handwritten notes are. I suppose with the originals I'm not now looking for.

This is not long. Suggest you read it with care and for more than the itemization of referrals to the CLA, which has not acted on them. Because these at CLA are all within a 1975 request this delay can't be because of any alleged backlog.

You may want to remember this for Monday and the 1996 status call and FRI/Givil intent on compliance.

Please return the original. I'm sending it because the blue ink may not copy well.

(14-12ing referrale FEI-CTIA #62-112697 177 pp. 33 serials. 1. Hoover's note on sire copy on formation of CTIA asks for memos on Fensterwald, Sprague, Tupling & Flammonde. He does not ask for one on Bull Turner, Fred Cook, so he apparently remembered the existing records on them-or had them in his office. Date 1/3/69? Garrison, too. Also ! Is the 1/6/69 memo. It notes files (77-44206) for Senatr Long's resignation and on Tupling, 100-179915-23, one of their internal security files. Sprague 62-109060-6520. 200 floover's 1/14/69 to CIA is CSCI-316/00108-69, with a Garrison title. Bud file is 77not recorded 1/4/69 letter from CIA referred to it.

(X) 2. 1/14/69 Rosen-DeLouch. Includes my name underlined, note says they have tape of his show on WAVA. Un 1st yellow pred -hel

3. moover's note on 3/18 wire copy calls "ud "a fraud."

7. Alexandria report, indicates inside source.

13. To this date, 7/24/12 all FOIA requests handled by Crime Records Pivision. This leave no doubt about the Crimes "ecord function"; "These [FOIA] matters questions are matters of law, not publicity." So they suggest transfer to Office Legal Counsel.

13,14,14X can be helpful in Ca75-226. They report what Gallagehor his that I do not believe I received, state policy not to deliver and "epartment policy to deliver and avoid litigation that can establish an unwanted precedent. Separate copies to JL and for me for possible supplemental afridavit in 226.

15. May supply the answer on how the Dallas F.I had the pictures from rexico City 11/23/63-"flown to Dallas by SA Rudd" this says Jecember 23. Accident? Deliberate? Coincidence?

16 withheld without explanation

18,19 referred to CIA. 2pp and 3pp. Will work!

20 I Bob Smith's pro se suit on his three requests. There are three records all with this same serial, 20. The second has a false, misrepresentative and misleading affidavit by then Inspector ohn A. Mintz, as of this moment being considered to be Director. e does state a policy directly opposite freedom of information.

24 Referred to CIA.

Not recorded 11/13/72 withheld under b1.

31 ref to CIA

7 added pages, separate worksheet

191-34552/100-454525/7100-467172/170-5905/962-10960, 6053,6054. 100-454525 has masked source on Bud and ref to a Detroit inquiry apparently by him, from a source there, I suppose. Det. may be second record above. Third had confidential source with WEO request, do they want coverage by source. 6210960 on Giesebrecht, 6064 Hoover's note asking for memo on it. But no ref. to CTIA.