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EBI—CTIA #62-112697 177 pp. 33 serisals.

i. Hoover's note on wire copy on formation of CTIA msks for memos on Fensterwald, Sprague,
Tupling & Flammonde, He does not ask for one on Bull Turner, Fred Cook, so he apparently
remembered the ezisting records on them—or had them in his office. Date 1/3/69? Garrigon, too.

i
2180 1'Id the 1/6/69 memo. It notes files (77-44206)£f0r benagr Long's resignation and on
)( Tupling, 100=179915=23, one¢ of their Internal Security files.Sprague 62-109060-6520,

Aot EeREIPde1/14/69 to CIA is CSCI-316/00108~69, with a Garrison title. bud file is 77-
44206—340 ; o

not recorded 1/4/69 letter from CLA referred to it.

JK 2. 1/14/69 Rosen-DeLoach. Includes m¥ name underlined, note says they have tape off?is show
on WAaVA. e ﬂ*i ) -

1

- 3. Hoover's note on 3/18 wire copy calls “ud "a fraud."
ﬁ. Alexandria report, indicates ineide source.

1 ¢
Not recordeds of 6/9,6/15 and 6/30/72 referred to CLi., Also 7/16/72. N

. 1%« To this date, 7/24/(2 all FOIA reguests handled by Crime Records “ivision. $h15
' leave no doubt about the Crimes Record functionl;"These [FOIA] muikmxs questions are
*“; natters of law, not publicity." So they suggest trunsffer to Office Legal Counsel,

13,14,14X can be helpful in Ca75-226, They report what Gallagehsr he'd that I do not

>< 'believe I received, atate policy not to dellverﬁ and “ecpartment policy to deliver and
iavoid litigation that can establish an unwanted precedent. Separate copies to JL and for
me for possible supplemental affidavit in 226.
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ﬁ

15. Hay supply the answer on how the Dalias Fsl had the pictures from *exico City 11/23/63-
\ i"flown to Dallas by SA Rudd" this aaySIﬂecember 23. Accident? Peliberate? Coincildence? “
)f‘16 withheld without explanation ' ' i *
Pi’)d 17 Is memo with incomplete Guiterrez Valencia report CD 566 attachad.-vgﬂ?f ~ -vdh;'

‘18 18 referred to ( L. 2pp and 3pp. 7@44k

; '20 I Bob Smith's pro se suit on his three Fequestse. There aretgg!ea records all with this

'5same serigl, 20. The second has a false, misrepresentative and misleading aeffidavit by
‘then Inspector “olmn A. tz, as of this moment being considered to be Dlrector. e does

! |state a policy directly opposite freedom of information. _ o :
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\/ |24 Referred to GLA. :
~ iNot recorded 11/13/72 withheld under bi. o
)(;'31reftocm | -

17 addqupages, seperate worksheet

7 91—345521100-454525?7100—4671%51 170—5905f9 62-10960, 6053,6054. 100-454525 has maéked source
ron Bud and ref to a Vetroit inquiry apparently by him, from a spurce there, I auppose. Det.
'may be second record above. Third had confidential source with WEO request, do they want

coverage by source. 6210960 on Giesebrecht, 6064 Hoover's note asking for memop on 1t. But
)( ;no ref. to CTIA, ;



