
  

  

ARGENTINE ROUNDUP 

BUENOS AIRES, Argentina, June 13 

—Maritime police held 40 suspects in- 

communicado today, searching for 
saboteurs who placed two bombs which 
exploded in the holds of the British 
freighter Gascony, killing a stevedore 
and injuring five others. 
Meanwhile the Interior Ministry for- 

bade teachers and students of Cordoba 
Province to comment on the European 

!| situation or to criticize the Argentine 
: | government, 

NICARAGUA WORRIED 

MANAGUA, Nicaragua, June 13— 
Deputy Octavio Pasos Montiel accused 
a majority of the members of the Nic- 
araguan Chamber of Deputies of be- 
longing to a “fifth column.” When 
deputies protested, he repeated the 
charge and offered to prove that nearly 
all Managua newspapers were paid by 
the German consulate, 

NAZIS IN URUGUAY 

MONTEVIDEO, Uruguay, June 13— 
It was announced last night that the 
German minister to Uruguay had in- 
formed the Uruguayan Minister of the 
Interior that all Nazi organizations anc 
the German Workers Union had heer 
dissolved.


